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MALTA 

 

COURT OF MAGISTRATES (MALTA) 
 AS A COURT OF CRIMINAL JUDICATURE 

 
 

MAGISTRATE  
ANTONIO GIOVANNI VELLA 

 
 
 

Sitting of the 8 th October, 2009 

 
 

Number. 1001/2009 
 
 
 

POLICE  
INSPECTOR JOSEPH HERSEY 

 
VS 

 
ROUBEN JUSTIN KOURY 

 
The Court; 
 
After seeing the charges brought against: 
 
Rouben Justin Koury, 39 years, son of Kristov and Gillian, 
born in Mulhouse on the 10th July 1970, residing at 
Trafalgar, Flat 1, Gulju Str, St. Paul’s Bay and holder of 
French passport number 05AR02518; 
 
 
 For Having: 
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1)  On the 26th September 2009, and in the previous 
days in Malta, with the intention of gain, helped, assisted, 
given advice or incited other people to attempt to enter or 
leave Malta against the Laws of Malta, or whether in Malta 
or outside Malta conspired with other people and this in 
breach of Article 337A of Chapter 9 of the Laws of Malta; 
 
2) Moreover, he is also charged with under 
circumstances in these islands, associated himself 
together with other persons in Malta or outside Malta with 
the intention of committing a crime in Malta (Article 337 A 
of Chapter 9 of the Laws of Malta) for which is punishable 
by imprisonment, and this in violation of Article 48A of 
Chapter 9 of the Laws of Malta; 
 
3) Moreover under the same circumstances  in 
these islands as a person that has a passport issued in 
his name (French Passport no. 05AR02518) from a 
competent authority or not transferred that same passport 
to another person (David Ba, Police No 06X- 011) and this 
in breach of Article 4 of Chapter 61 of the Laws of Malta; 
 
 
Considers: 
 
 
After having seen the Articles 337 A and 48 A of Chapter 
9 of the Laws of Malta and Article 4 of Chapter 61 of the 
Laws of Malta; 
 
After having heard the evidence and the documents 
exhibited; 
 
After having seen the accused admit the charges brought 
against him, which admission was confirmed by him after 
having been given due time to reconsider in accordance 
with the law; 
 
After having heard the accused’s plea and after having 
given the time prescribed by Law for the accused to 
consider his plea, this Court finds the said accused guilty 
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as charged and condemns him two (2) years 
imprisonment. 
 
 
The Court explained in clear words the terms of the 
judgement to the accused. 
 
 
 

< Final Judgement > 
 

----------------------------------END---------------------------------- 


