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Seduta ta' l-1 ta' April, 2005 

 
 

Numru. 152/2005 
 
 
 

 
The Police  

(Sp. Carmelo Bartolo)  
 

v 
 

Ezechukwu Prince Okeke 21 years, son 
of Obina Damian and Ada Rose nee 

unknown, born Nigeria on the 7th August, 
1983 and residing at 97, Xatt ta’ Bormla, Cospicua, 
holder of passport bearing the number A 23002263 

 
 

The Court, 
 
 
Has seen the charges agianst the abovementioned 
Ezechukwu Prince Okeke charged with having on these 
islands, on the 22nd February, 2005 at about 10.30 a.m. 
assaulted or resisted by violence or active force not 



Kopja Informali ta' Sentenza 

Pagna 2 minn 3 
Qrati tal-Gustizzja 

amounting to public violence, any person lawfully charged 
with a public duty namely Police Inspector Angelo 
Caruana when in the execution of the law or of a lawful 
order issued by a competent authority, 
 
And also with having on the same date, time, place and 
circumstances, reviled, or threatened, or caused a bodily 
harm to any person lawfully charged with a public duty 
namely Police Inspector Angelo Caruana, while in the act 
of discharging his duty or because his having discharged 
such duty, or with intent to intimidate or unduly influence 
him in the discharge of such duty, 
 
And also with having on the same date, time, place and 
circumstances without the intent to kill or put the life of 
any person namely Police Inspector Angelo Caruana in 
manifest jeopardy, caused him injuries of a slight nature 
as certified by Dr Joseph Galea MD of the Floriana Health 
Centre. 
 
And finally charge him with having on the same, date, 
time, place and circumstances, disobeyed the lawful 
orders of any authority or of any person entrusted with a 
public service, or hindered or obstructed such person in 
the exercise of his duties, or otherwise, unduly interfered 
with the exercise of such duties, either by preventing other 
persons from doing what they are lawfully enjoined or 
allowed to do, or frustrating or undoing what has been 
lawfully done by other persons, or in any manner 
whatsoever. 
 
Has seen that in today’s sitting he has registered a plea of 
guilt to the charges brought against him after having been 
given due time to understand the plea registered. 
 
Heard the accused under oath choose to explain the 
circumstances of the case leading to the charges he 
admitted to. 
 
Finds him guilty after having seen sections 95, 96, 221, 
338 of Chapter 9 of the Laws of Malta.  Has seen also 
section 17 of the same chapter. 
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Has seen his conviction sheet. 
 
After also having taken in consideration the fact that the 
accused has been under preventive arrest for these last 
five weeks. 
 
Applies section 22 of Chapter 446 and conditionally 
discharges him, under the condition that he is not to 
commit another crime within three years from today. 
 
 
 
 
 
 

< Sentenza Finali > 
 

---------------------------------TMIEM--------------------------------- 


